
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 19-0019

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for Standard/Wide Range 

FOR: Repair Clamps, Tap Clamps and Couplings

TIME & (Date of Award through December 31, 2019)

DATE: 3:00 p.m., February 27, 2019
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

GROUP 1 STANDARD REPAIR CLAMPS, MULTIPLE BAND      

20 ea.  (SAWS #10382)      

Clamp, full circle repair, size 12" x 15", Range B PRICE 259.30   461.07  

13.64 - 14.85, material stainless steel TOTAL 5,186.00 NO BID NO BID 9,221.40 NO BID

1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 227   QCRS151490001EX  

20 ea.  (SAWS #10384) UNIT      

Clamp, full circle repair, size 16" x 10", Range A PRICE 212.61   434.31  

 18.08 - 18.84, material stainless steel TOTAL 4,252.20 NO BID NO BID 8,686.20 NO BID

2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228   QCRS121942001EX  

40 ea.  (SAWS #10385) UNIT      

Size 16" x 20", Range B 17.15 - 17.90, material PRICE 389.81   830.74  

stainless steel TOTAL 15,592.40 NO BID NO BID 33,229.60 NO BID

3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228   QCRS201830001EX  

20 ea.  (SAWS #10386) UNIT      

Clamp, full circle repair, size 16" x 20", Range C PRICE 403.11   830.74  

18.46 - 19.21, material stainless steel TOTAL 8,062.20 NO BID NO BID 16,614.80 NO BID

4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228   QCRS201942001EX  

10 ea.  (SAWS #10389) UNIT      

Clamp, full circle repair, size 20" x 10", Range A PRICE 258.40   477.23  

22.90 - 23.65, material stainless steel TOTAL 2,584.00 NO BID NO BID 4,772.30 NO BID

5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228   QCRS122336001EX  

 10 ea.  (SAWS #10390) UNIT      

Full circle repair, size 20" x 20", Range B 21.52 - 22.27, PRICE 486.98   854.24  

material stainless steel TOTAL 4,869.80 NO BID NO BID 8,542.40 NO BID

6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228   QCRS202249001EX  

5 ea.  (SAWS #10387) UNIT      

Clamp, full circle repair, size 20" x 20", Range C PRICE 422.57   912.32  

23.21 - 23.97, material stainless steel TOTAL 2,112.85 NO BID NO BID 4,561.60 NO BID

7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228   QCRS202415001EX  

5 ea. (SAWS #10392) UNIT      

Clamp, full circle repair, size 24" x 10", Range A PRICE 447.51   634.56  

27.28 - 28.34, material stainless steel TOTAL 2,237.55 NO BID NO BID 3,172.80 NO BID

8. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228   QCRS122970001EX  

 10 ea.   (SAWS #10394) UNIT      

Clamp, full circle repair, size 24" x 20", Range B PRICE 803.23   958.37  

25.70 - 26.80, material stainless steel TOTAL 8,032.30 NO BID NO BID 9,583.70 NO BID

9. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228   QCRS202738001EX  

10 ea.  (SAWS #10391) UNIT      

Clamp, full circle repair, size 24" x 20", Range C PRICE 790.77   1,269.56  

27.65-28.75, material stainless steel TOTAL 7,907.70 NO BID NO BID 12,695.60 NO BID

10. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 228   QCRS202970001EX  

*  

TOTAL GROUP 1 TOTAL 60,837.00 NO BID NO BID 111,080.40 NO BID

GROUP 2 STANDARD DUCTILE IRON COUPLING UNIT       

200 ea.  (SAWS #10992) PRICE 26.33   52.46   

Coupling, Cast, Size 2", Range 2.34" - 2.6" TOTAL 5,266.00 NO BID NO BID 10,492.00 NO BID NO BID

Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441   JCM 215-0250   

*

TOTAL GROUP 2 TOTAL 5,266.00 NO BID NO BID 10,492.00 NO BID NO BID
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ra

u
sz

 U
S

A
, 

In
c.

C
o
re

 &
 M

ai
n
 L

P

1
3
7
9
0
 J

u
d
so

n
 R

d
.

S
an

 A
n
to

n
io

, 
T

X
 7

8
2
3
3

A
ct

 P
ip

e 
&

 S
u
p
p
ly

4
7
1
9
 D

o
d
g
e 

S
tr

ee
t

S
an

 A
n
to

n
io

, 
T

X
 7

8
2
1
7

F
o
rt

il
in

e

3
0
1
1
 N

o
rt

h
 P

an
 A

m
 E

x
p
y

S
an

 A
n
to

n
io

, 
T

X
 7

8
2
1
9

G
aj

es
k
e,

 I
n
c.

1
3
4
0
6
 W

es
te

rn
 O

ak

H
el

o
te

s,
 T

X
 7

8
0
2
3

T
o
ta

l 
P

ip
in

g
 S

o
lu

ti
o
n
s,

 I
n
c.

P
.O

. 
B

o
x
 5

2
5

O
le

an
, 

N
Y

 1
4
7
6
0

GROUP 3 ACME REPAIR CLAMPS

100 ea.  (SAWS #10365) UNIT      

Clamp, Acme Repair, Size 6", Length 7-1/2" Material PRICE 45.48     

Stainless Steel, One Brand Range 6.84-7.24 TOTAL 4,548.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 226     

40 ea.  (SAWS #10366) UNIT      

Clamp, Acme Repair, Size 8", Length 7-1/2", Material Stainless PRICE 54.41     

Steel, One Berand Range 8.99-9.36 TOTAL 2,176.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 226     

10 ea.  (SAWS #10448) UNIT      

Clamp, Acme Repair, Size 10", Length 7-1/2", Material PRICE 66.22     

Stainless Steel, One Brand Range 11.34-11.74 TOTAL 662.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 226     

20 ea.  (SAWS #10364) UNIT      

Clamp, Acme Repair, Size 12", Length 7-1/2", Material PRICE 77.50     

Stainless Steel Range 13.70-1410 TOTAL 1,550.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 226     

10 ea.  (SAWS #10363) UNIT      

Clamp, Acme Full Circle Repair, Size 16", Length 10", Range 17.82 - 18.57, Material PRICE 227.17     

Stainless Steel One Band, used for Large Diameter Pipe Coupling TOTAL 2,271.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 226     

  *     

       

 TOTAL GROUP 3 TOTAL 11,208.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GROUP 4 BELL JOINT LEAK CLAMPS        

60  ea.  (SAWS #10375)

Clamp, bell joint leak, size 6", material ductile iron UNIT

epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range PRICE 108.26 97.08  91.76   

6.90 - 7.10 TOTAL 6,495.60 5,824.80 NO BID 5,505.60 NO BID NO BID

1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 274 143-0690  JCM 143-0690   

25 ea.  (SAWS #10376)

Clamp, bell joint leak, size 8", material ductile iron UNIT  

epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range PRICE 149.57 134.59  127.21   

9.05 - 9.30 TOTAL 3,739.25 3,364.75 NO BID 3,180.25 NO BID NO BID

2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 274 143-0905  JCM 143-0905   

5 ea.  (SAWS #10369)  

Clamp, bell joint leak, size 10", material ductile iron UNIT

epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range PRICE 187.95 181.19 NO BID 171.26 NO BID NO BID

11.10 - 11.40 TOTAL 939.75 905.95  856.30   

3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 274 143-1110  JCM 143-1110   

10 ea.  (SAWS #10370) UNIT

Clamp, bell joint leak, size 12", material ductile iron

epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range PRICE 203.29 209.14 NO BID 197.67 NO BID NO BID

13.20 - 13.50 TOTAL 2,032.90 2,091.40  1,976.70   

4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 274 143-1320  JCM 143-1320   

5 ea.  (SAWS #10371) UNIT

Clamp, bell joint leak, size 16", material ductile iron 

epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range PRICE 317.43 865.70 NO BID 818.25 NO BID NO BID

17.40 - 17.80 TOTAL 1,587.15 4,328.50  4,091.25   

5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 274 143-1740  JCM 143-1740   

5 ea.  (SAWS #10372) UNIT

Clamp, bell joint leak, size 20", material ductile iron

epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range PRICE 512.26 1,015.68 NO BID 960.00 NO BID NO BID

21.60 - 22.06 TOTAL 2,561.30 5,078.40  4,800.00   

6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 274 143-2160  JCM 143-2160   
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5 ea.  (SAWS #10373) UNIT

Clamp, bell joint leak, size 24" material ductile iron

epoxy coated, includes gaskets, nuts & bolts range PRICE 583.40 1,189.11 NO BID 1,123.92 NO BID NO BID

25.80 - 26.32 TOTAL 2,917.00 5,945.55  5,619.60   

7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 274 143-2580  JCM 143-2580   

  *      

  

 TOTAL GROUP 4 TOTAL 20,272.95 27,539.35 NO BID 26,029.70 NO BID NO BID

GROUP 5 REDI CLAMPS UNIT       

25  ea.  (SAWS #10437) PRICE 4.49 6.79  5.54 6.94  

Clamp, Redi, size 1/2", length 3", material stainless steel TOTAL 112.25 169.75 NO BID 138.50 173.50 NO BID

1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245 110-0084  JCM 220-0084 41030084150  

  UNIT       

100 ea.  (SAWS #10443) PRICE 4.57 7.64  6.23 7.51  

Clamp, Redi, size 3/4", length 3", material stainless steel TOTAL 457.00 764.00 NO BID 623.00 751.00 NO BID

2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245 110-0105  JCM 220-0105 41030105150  

UNIT   

40 ea.  (SAWS #10436) PRICE 5.00 10.28  8.38 8.40  

Clamp, Redi, size 1", length 3", material stainless steel TOTAL 200.00 411.20 NO BID 335.20 336.00 NO BID

3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245 110-0132  JCM 220-0132 41030132150  

UNIT   

50 ea.  (SAWS #10438) PRICE 5.51 14.24  11.61 9.86  

Clamp, Redi, size 1-1/2", length 3", material stainless steel TOTAL 275.50 712.00 NO BID 580.50 493.00 NO BID

4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245 110-0190  JCM 220-0190 41030190150  

UNIT   

10 ea.  (SAWS #10439) PRICE 5.13 12.50  10.17 9.16  

Clamp, Redi, size 1-1/4", length 3", material stainless steel TOTAL 51.30 125.00 NO BID 101.70 91.60 NO BID

5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245 110-0166  JCM 220-0166 41030166150  

UNIT   

45 ea.  (SAWS #10440) PRICE 10.92 11.34  9.25 26.18  

Clamp, Redi, size 2", length 6", material stainless steel TOTAL 491.40 510.30 NO BID 416.25 1,178.10 NO BID

6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245 110-0238  JCM 220-0238 41060238150  

UNIT   

30 ea.  (SAWS #10441) PRICE 15.07 15.49  12.63 28.14  

Clamp, Redi, size 2-1/2", length 6", material stainless steel TOTAL 452.10 464.70 NO BID 378.90 844.20 NO BID

7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245 110-0288  JCM 220-0288 41060288150  

UNIT   

10 ea.  (SAWS #10442) PRICE 15.97 16.76  13.66 30.64  

Clamp, Redi, size 3", length 6", material stainless steel TOTAL 159.70 167.60 NO BID 136.60 306.40 NO BID

8. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245 110-0350  JCM 220-0350 41060350150  

UNIT   

10 ea.  (SAWS #10445) PRICE 17.01 17.73  14.46 34.34  

Clamp, Redi, size 4, length 6", material stainless steel TOTAL 170.10 177.30 NO BID 144.60 343.40 NO BID

9. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 245 110-0450  JCM 220-0450 41060450150  

 *      

 

 TOTAL GROUP 5 TOTAL 2,369.35 3,501.85 NO BID 2,855.25 4,517.20 NO BID

GROUP 6 FLANGE ADAPTER STEEL COUPLING UNIT

20 ea.  (SAWS #11035) PRICE 110.57 74.18 70.11

Coupling, flange adapter, size 3", material steel TOTAL 2,211.40 1,483.60 NO BID 1,402.20 NO BID NO BID

1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 301-0350 JCM 301-0350

20 ea.  (SAWS #11037)  

Coupling, flange UNIT

Coupling, flange adapter, size 4", OD size 4.5 - 4.80, used for PRICE 134.89 96.22 90.95

steel pipe TOTAL 2,697.80 1,924.40 NO BID 1,819.00 NO BID NO BID

2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 301-0450 JCM 301-0450

3
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UNIT

15 ea.  (SAWS #11039) PRICE 168.61 122.89 116.15

Coupling, flange and adapter, size 6", used for steel TOTAL 2,529.15 1,843.35 NO BID 1,742.25 NO BID NO BID

3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 301-0663 JCM 301-0663

UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #11041) PRICE 209.39 168.67 159.42

Coupling, flange adapter, size 8", material steel TOTAL 1,046.95 843.35 NO BID 797.10 NO BID NO BID

4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 301-0863 JCM 301-0863

5 ea.  (SAWS #11027) UNIT

Coupling, flange adapter, size 10", material steel used for PRICE 262.71 305.53 288.78

steel pipe TOTAL 1,313.55 1,527.65 NO BID 1,443.90 NO BID NO BID

5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 301-1075 JCM 301-1075

3 ea.  (SAWS #11029) UNIT

Coupling, flange adapter, size 12", OD size 12.75,  used PRICE 308.98 338.76 NO BID 320.18 NO BID NO BID

for steel pipe TOTAL 926.94 1,016.28 960.54

6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 301-1275 JCM 301-1275

 

    *

       

 TOTAL GROUP 6 TOTAL 10,725.79 8,638.63 NO BID 8,164.99 NO BID NO BID

GROUP 7 FLANGE ADAPTER CAST IRON COUPLING  

20 ea.  (SAWS #11034) UNIT    

Coupling, flange adapter, size 3", OD size 3.80-3.96, material PRICE 65.95 74.18 70.11

cast iron TOTAL 1,319.00 1,483.60 NO BID 1,402.20 NO BID NO BID

1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 301-0396 JCM 301-0396

50 ea.  (SAWS #11036) UNIT

Coupling, flange adapter, size 4", OD size 4.74 - 5.10, used for PRICE 82.34 96.22 90.95

cast iron pipe TOTAL 4,117.00 4,811.00 NO BID 4,547.50 NO BID NO BID

2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 301-0480 JCM 301-0480

25 ea.  (SAWS #11038) UNIT

Coupling, flange adapter, size 6", OD size 6.90 - 7.20, PRICE 105.13 122.89 116.15

material cast iron TOTAL 2,628.25 3,072.25 NO BID 2,903.75 NO BID NO BID

3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 301-0690 JCM 301-0690

UNIT

10 ea.   (SAWS #11040) PRICE 144.32 168.67 159.42

Coupling, flange adapter, size 8", material cast iron TOTAL 1,443.20 1,686.70 NO BID 1,594.20 NO BID NO BID

4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 301-0905 JCM 301-0905

5 ea.   (SAWS #11028) UNIT

Coupling, flange adapter, size 10", OD size 11.10,  material PRICE 261.27 305.53 288.78

cast iron TOTAL 1,306.35 1,527.65 NO BID 1,443.90 NO BID NO BID

5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 301-1110 JCM 301-1110

UNIT

5 ea.  (SAWS #11042) PRICE 290.55 338.76 320.18

Coupling, flange adapter, size 12", OD size 13.20 TOTAL 1,452.75 1,693.80 NO BID 1,600.90 NO BID NO BID

6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 301-1320 JCM 301-1320

5 ea.  (SAWS #11032) UNIT

Coupling, flanged adapter, size 20", used for ductile iron PRICE 656.38 877.68 829.57

pipe range 21.35 - 21.75 TOTAL 3,281.90 4,388.40 NO BID 4,147.85 NO BID NO BID

7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 303-2160x20 303-2160x20

5 ea.  (SAWS #11033) UNIT

Coupling, flanged adapter, size 24", used for ductile iron PRICE 757.56 1,012.40 956.90

pipe range 25.71 - 25.89 TOTAL 3,787.80 5,062.00 NO BID 4,784.50 NO BID NO BID

8. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 303-2580x24 303-2580x24

4
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4 ea.  (SAWS #11044) UNIT    

Coupling, flanged adapter, size 30" used for ductile iron PRICE 919.96 1,803.20 1,704.35

pipe, range 31.91 - 32.09 TOTAL 3,679.84 7,212.80 NO BID 6,817.40 NO BID NO BID

9. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 913 303-3200x30 303-3200x30

 *   

  

TOTAL GROUP 7 TOTAL 23,016.09 30,938.20 NO BID 29,242.20 NO BID NO BID

GROUP 8 STEEL COUPLING  

 UNIT    

20 ea.  (SAWS #10935) PRICE 44.36 42.99 NO BID 40.52 NO BID NO BID

Coupling, steel, size 3" used for steel pipe TOTAL 887.20 859.80  810.40   

1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 411 201-035001  JCM 201-035001   

UNIT

10 ea.   (SAWS #10963) PRICE 56.05 50.93 48.14

Coupling, steel, size 4", used for steel pipe TOTAL 560.50 509.30 NO BID 481.40 NO BID NO BID

2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 411 201-045001 JCM 201-045001

UNIT

4 ea.  (SAWS #10958) PRICE 89.16 69.48 65.67

Coupling, steel 38, size 6", OD size 6.625 TOTAL 356.64 277.92 NO BID 262.68 NO BID NO BID

3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 411 201-066301 JCM 201-066301

UNIT

2 ea.  (SAWS #10954) PRICE 131.51 107.02 101.15

Coupling, steel 38, size 10"  TOTAL 263.02 214.04 NO BID 202.30 NO BID NO BID

4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 411 201-107501 JCM 201-107501

UNIT

4 ea.  (SAWS #10955) PRICE 158.32 123.35 116.59

Coupling, steel 38, size 12", OD size 12.75 TOTAL 633.28 493.40 NO BID 466.36 NO BID NO BID

5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 411 201-127501 JCM 201-127501

UNIT

2 ea.  (SAWS #10956) PRICE 423.63 478.84 452.59

Coupling, steel 38, size 20", OD size 20.00 - 21.60 TOTAL 847.26 957.68 NO BID 905.18 NO BID NO BID

6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 411 201-216007 JCM 201-216007

UNIT

2 ea.  (SAWS #10957) PRICE 456.13 523.70 494.99

Coupling, steel 38, size 24", OD size 24.00 TOTAL 912.26 1,047.40 NO BID 989.98 NO BID NO BID

7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 411 201-240007 JCM 201-240007

   *

 

TOTAL GROUP 8 TOTAL 4,460.16 4,359.54 NO BID 4,118.30 NO BID NO BID

GROUP 9 TRANSITION COUPLING       

5 ea.  (SAWS #11243) UNIT

Coupling, transition, size 10", range DI 11.10 - 11.50 x PRICE 131.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AC 11.60 - 12.12 TOTAL 655.60     

1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441     

10 ea.  (SAWS #11232) UNIT

Coupling, transition, size 12", range DI 13.20 - 13.50 PRICE 145.08     

AC 13.90 - 14.2 TOTAL 1,450.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441     
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5 ea. (SAWS #11234) UNIT

Coupling, transition, size 16", range 17.40 - 17.40 to PRICE 276.85     

17.40 - 17.80 TOTAL 1,384.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441     

5 ea.  (SAWS #11235) UNIT

Coupling, transition, size 16", range 17.40 - 17.80 x PRICE 276.85     

18.46 - 19.00 TOTAL 1,384.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 441     

3 ea.  (SAWS #11237) UNIT

Coupling, transition, size 20", range 21.60 - 22.06 PRICE 433.60     

 TOTAL 1,300.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 413     

3 ea.  (SAWS #11239) UNIT

Coupling, transition, size 24", range 25.30 - 25.80 x PRICE 523.31     

26.10 26.32 TOTAL 1,569.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 413     

3 ea.  (SAWS #11230) UNIT

Coupling, transition, size 24", range 25.75 - 26.42 x PRICE 518.37     

27.95 -28.62 TOTAL 1,555.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

7. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 413     

3 ea.  (SAWS #11238) UNIT

Coupling, transition, size 24", range 25.80 x 26.32, PRICE 523.31     

material steel TOTAL 1,569.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

8. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smith Blair 413     

 *     

 

TOTAL GROUP 9 TOTAL 10,870.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GROUP 10 DRESSER COUPLING UNIT     

50 ea.  (SAWS #11011) PRICE 7.07 6.80  5.91 7.34  

Coupling, 65B Dresser, size 1/2", material galvanized range TOTAL 353.50 340.00 NO BID 295.50 367.00 NO BID

1. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smth Blair 525 220-0084  JCM 220-0084 6000-0840-150  

150 ea.  (SAWS #10971) UNIT

Coupling, dresser, size 3/4", end type comp x comp, material PRICE 8.22 7.64  6.64 8.16  

galvanized, style 65 long range TOTAL 1,233.00 1,146.00 NO BID 996.00 1,224.00 NO BID

2. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smth Blair 525 220-0105  JCM 220-0105 6000-1050-150  

100 ea.  (SAWS #11010) UNIT

Coupling, dresser, size 1", end type comp x comp material PRICE 9.29 10.28  8.93 10.94  

galvanized, style 65B long range TOTAL 929.00 1,028.00 NO BID 893.00 1,094.00 NO BID

3. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smth Blair 525 220-0132  JCM 220-0132 6000-1315-150  

UNIT

60 ea.  (SAWS #10968) PRICE 13.65 14.24  12.38 15.33  

Coupling, 65B Dresser, size 1-1/2", material galvanized range TOTAL 819.00 854.40 NO BID 742.80 919.80 NO BID

4. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smth Blair 525 220-0190  JCM 220-0190 6000-1900-150  

UNIT

10 ea.  (SAWS #10969) PRICE 12.08 12.49  10.86 13.29  

Coupling, 65B dresser, size 1-1/4", material galvanized range TOTAL 120.80 124.90 NO BID 108.60 132.90 NO BID

5. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smth Blair 525 220-0166  JCM 220-0166 6000-1660-150  
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UNIT

80 ea.  (SAWS #10970) PRICE 16.94 20.00  17.39 21.68  

coupling, 65B dresser, size 2", material galvanized range TOTAL 1,355.20 1,600.00 NO BID 1,391.20 1,734.40 NO BID

6. Make and Model MAKE/MODEL Smth Blair 525 220-0238   6000-2375-150  

    *   

 

TOTAL GROUP 10 TOTAL 4,810.50 5,093.30 NO BID 4,427.10 5,472.10 NO BID

GROUP 11 WIDE RANGE TRANSITION COUPLING UNIT     

250 ea.  (SAWS #27624 PRICE 133.00 139.10 143.42 196.57

Coupling, Wide Range, Transition, Size 4", Range 4.25-5.63 TOTAL 33,250.00 34,775.00 35,855.00 49,142.50

1. Approved Model Hymax 2000 MAKE/MODEL Krausz 860-56  Hymax Krausz 860-56-0108-16C NO BID

1,600 ea. (SAWS #276525) UNIT PRICE 176.00 184.20 189.94 260.34

Coupling, Wide Range, Transition, Size 6", Range 6.42-7.68 TOTAL 281,600.00 294,720.00 303,904.00 416,544.00

2. Approved Model Hymax 2000 MAKE/MODEL Krausz 860-56  Hymax Krausz 860-56-0163-16 NO BID

800 ea. (SAWS #27626) UNIT PRICE 199.00 208.00 214.45 293.92

Coupling, Wide Range Transition, Size 8", Range 8.54-9384 TOTAL 159,200.00 166,400.00 171,560.00 235,136.00

3. Approved Model Hymax 2000 MAKE/MODEL Krausz 860-56  Hymax Krausz 860-56-0217-16 NO BID

100 ea. (SAWS #27627) UNIT PRICE 256.00 267.50 275.87 378.11

Coupling, Wide Range Transition, Size 10", Range 10.70-12.00 TOTAL 25,600.00 26,750.00 27,587.00 37,811.00

4. Approved Model Hymax 2000 MAKE/MODEL Krausz 860-56  Hymax Krausz 860-56-0272-16 NO BID

300 ea. (SAWS #27628) UNIT PRICE 369.00 385.30 397.33 544.60

Coupling, Wide Range Transition, Size 12", Range 13.15-14.41 TOTAL 110,700.00 115,590.00 119,199.00 163,380.00

5. Approved Model Hymax 2000 MAKE/MODEL Krausz 860-56  Hymax Krausz 860-56-0334-16 NO BID

100 ea. (SAWS #27629) UNIT PRICE 812.75 848.30 874.68 1,198.88

Coupling, Wide Range Transition, Size 16", Range 17.10-19.20 TOTAL 81,275.00 84,830.00 87,468.00 119,888.00

6. Approved Model Hymax 2000 MAKE/MODEL Krausz 860-56  Hymax Krausz 860-56-0434-16P NO BID

40 ea. (SAWS #11231) UNIT PRICE 1,032.00 1,077.00 1,111.29 1,523.18

Coupling, Wide Range Transition, Size 20", Range 21.50-23.60 TOTAL 41,280.00 43,080.00 44,451.60 60,927.20

7. Approved Model Hymax 2000 MAKE/MODEL Krausz 860-56  Hymax Krausz 860-56-0540-16P NO BID

30 ea. (SAWS #27631) UNIT PRICE 1,099.00 1,147.00 1,183.32 1,621.91

Coupling, Wide Range Transition, Size 24", Range 24.60-26.70 TOTAL 32,970.00 34,410.00 35,499.60 48,657.30

8. Approved Model Hymax 2000 MAKE/MODEL Krausz 860-56  Hymax Krausz 860-56-0624-16P NO BID

 *    

 

TOTAL GROUP 11 TOTAL 765,875.00 800,555.00 825,524.20 1,131,486.00 NO BID

GROUP 12 CLAMP VERSA MAX     

25 ea. (SAWS #41745) UNIT PRICE 709.00 741.50 764.83 1,048.30

Clamp Versa Max 24" undersize, Range 34.98-26.24; SS 304, Mfg. Total Piping TOTAL 17,725.00 18,537.50 19,120.75 26,207.50

1. Solution, Approved Model 3111-2624-175-MAX MAKE/MODEL Krausz 283-56-0634-11  Hymax Versa Krausz 283-56-0634-11 NO BID NO BID

25 ea. (SAWS #41746) UNIT PRICE 767.00 800.25 825.40 1,131.33

Clamp Versa Max 24" undersize, Range 25.72-26.98; SS 304, Mfg. Total Piping TOTAL 19,175.00 20,006.25 20,635.00 28,283.25

2. Solution, Approved Model 3111-2698-175-MAX MAKE/MODEL Krausz 283-56-0653-11  Hymax Versa Krausz 283-56-0653-11 NO BID NO BID

25 ea. (SAWS #41747) UNIT PRICE 782.00 816.50 842.23 1,154.39

Clamp Versa Max 24" Oversize, Range 27.08-28.36; SS304, Mfg. Total Piping TOTAL 19,550.00 20,412.50 21,055.75 28,859.75

3. Solution, Approved Model 3111-2836-175-Max MAKE/MODEL Krausz 283-56-0688-11  Hymax Versa Krausz 283-56-0688-11 NO BID NO BID

*    

TOTAL GROUP 12 TOTAL 56,450.00 58,956.25 60,811.50 83,350.50 NO BID NO BID

GROUP 13 CLAMP HYDRO FLEX      

25 ea. (SAWS #41750) UNIT PRICE 709.00 741.50 764.83 1,048.30  

Clamp Hydro Flex 24 inch 25.55 to fit pipe OD 25.55 100 PSI; SS 304, Mfg. Total TOTAL 17,725.00 18,537.50 19,120.75 26,207.50  

1. Piping Solution, Approved Model 3000 Series #301125392579100 MAKE/MODEL 283-56-0634-11  Hymax Versa Krausz 283-56-0634-11 NO BID NO BID

25 ea. (SAWS #41751) UNIT PRICE 709.00 741.50 764.83 1,048.30   

Clamp Hydro Flex 24 inch 25.80 to fit pipe OD 25.80 100 psi; SS304, Mfg. Total TOTAL 17,725.00 18,537.50 19,120.75 26,207.50   

2. Piping Solution, Approved Model 3000 Series #301125592599100 MAKE/MODEL 283-56-0634-11  Hymax Versa Krausz 283-56-0634-11 NO BID NO BID
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25 ea. (SAWS #41725) UNIT PRICE 767.00 800.25 825.40 1,131.33   

Clamp Hydro Flex 24 inch 26.32 to fit pipe OD 26.32 100 PSI; SS 304, Mfg: Total TOTAL 19,175.00 20,006.25 20,635.00 28,283.25   

3. Piping Solution, Approved Model 3000 Series #301126102650100 MAKE/MODEL 283-56-0653-11  Hymax Versa Krausz 283-56-0651-11 NO BID NO BID

25 ea. (SAWS #41753) UNIT PRICE 782.00 816.50 842.23 1,154.39   

Clamp Hydro Flex 24-Inch 28.22 to fit pipe OD 28.22 100 psi; SS 304, Mfg. Total TOTAL 19,550.00 20,412.50 21,055.75 28,859.75   

4. Piping Solution, Approved Model 3000 Series #301127952835100 MAKE/MODEL 283-56-0688-11  Hymax Versa Krausz 283-56-0688-11 NO BID NO BID

*     

TOTAL GROUP 13 TOTAL 74,175.00 77,493.75 79,932.25 109,558.00 NO BID NO BID

GROUP 14 MISCELLANEOUS COUPLING     

25 ea. (SAWS #41748) UNIT 1,099.00 1,147.00 1,183.32 1,621.91

Coupling Reducing 24" Hymax, Range 23.85-24.96x24.88-25.95, Mfg. Total PRICE 27,475.00 28,675.00 29,583.00 40,547.75

1. Piping Solution, Approved Model 200-2595-232 TOTAL Krausz 860-56  Hymax Versa Krausz 860-56-0606-16P NO BID NO BID

25 ea. (SAWS #41749) UNIT 2,407.00 2,512.00 2,590.21 3,550.26

Flanged Adaptor Coupling 24 OS, Range 24.60-25.67 x 25.59-26.70, Mfg: Total PRICE 60,175.00 62,800.00 64,755.25 88,756.50

2. Piping Solution, Approved Model 2100-2670-175 TOTAL Krausz 875-56  Hymax Versa Krausz 874-56-24062412 NO BID NO BID

*    

TOTAL GROUP 14 TOTAL 87,650.00 91,475.00 94,338.25 129,304.25 NO BID NO BID

AWARD TOTALS FOR VENDORS TOTAL 1,117,990.36 16,710.39

EXTENSION 1  1,117,990.36 16,710.39

Net Net Net Net 1%

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 10 days

Delivery Days

*LOW BIDDER:  

INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Act Pipe & Supply Hugh Cunningham Demandstar

Core & Main Mission Clay SAWS Website

Ferguson Waterworks Morrison

Fortiline Pipe Movers

Gajeske Total Piping Solutions

HD Supply Waterworks Williams Supply
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